

NELSON MADDEN BLACK LLP

5 Bryant Park, 27th Floor
New York, New York 10018
Telephone (212) 382-4300
nelsonmaddenblack.com

INVOICE

Date: 12/25/2017
Due On: 01/24/2018

Mahwah Township

00105-Mahwah Township:Eruv Litigation

Eruv Litigation

Date	Notes	Initials	Time	Rate	Total
08/16/2017	Background research; uploaded documents and information to Clio.	CM	0.65	\$110.00	\$71.50
08/17/2017	Phone call from Debra Kostroun re PR firm Robert Zito; phone conference scheduled.	BB	0.25	\$350.00	\$87.50
08/17/2017	Phone with Deborah Kostroun and Bob Zito re possible PR representation.	BB	0.57	\$350.00	\$199.50
08/17/2017	Search for [REDACTED] [REDACTED] uploaded information to Clio.	CM	3.47	\$110.00	\$381.70
08/18/2017	Call with J. McGuire re [REDACTED] emails to all counsel.	BB	0.39	\$350.00	\$136.50
08/18/2017	Phone call to R. Hermansen re-scheduling meeting Thursday.	BB	0.14	\$350.00	\$49.00
08/18/2017	Review of and research on relevant subject matter.	BB	0.77	\$350.00	\$269.50
08/22/2017	Discussed key legal arguments concerning [REDACTED] with B. Black.	EB	0.59	\$225.00	\$132.75
08/24/2017	Attended live Facebook broadcast of Township Council meeting.	BB	2.22	\$350.00	\$777.00
08/25/2017	Discussed legal arguments with B. Black and conducted research on [REDACTED]	EB	1.20	\$225.00	\$270.00
08/25/2017	Met with E. Bechara, assigned research. Began reviewing relevant [REDACTED]	BB	3.20	\$350.00	\$1,120.00

12/26/2017

09/28/2017	Phone conference with Township Attorney, HSG et al. re strategy going forward.	BB	0.45	\$350.00	\$157.50
08/30/2017	Meeting with J. Nelson re [REDACTED].	BB	0.25	\$350.00	\$87.50
08/30/2017	Discussed [REDACTED] with B. Black in light of [REDACTED]	JN	0.25	\$350.00	\$87.50
09/07/2017	Met with B. Chewcaskle, M. Giacobbe, R. Gantner, J. McGuire. Drove the length of the aruy from NYS to Saddle River.	BB	6.09	\$350.00	\$2,131.50
09/12/2017	Legal research on [REDACTED]	BB	1.71	\$350.00	\$598.50
09/12/2017	Review of [REDACTED]	BB	0.75	\$350.00	\$262.50
09/12/2017	Met with E. Bechara re [REDACTED]	BB	0.90	\$350.00	\$316.00
09/12/2017	Met with B. Black regarding [REDACTED]	EB	0.89	\$225.00	\$200.25
09/12/2017	Researched case law relating to [REDACTED]	EB	1.20	\$225.00	\$270.00
09/13/2017	Researched [REDACTED]	BB	3.20	\$350.00	\$1,120.00
09/13/2017	Met with J. Madden to discuss [REDACTED]	BB	0.90	\$350.00	\$315.00
09/13/2017	Conference with B. Black to review [REDACTED] meeting at HSG; meeting with McGuire and Goldberg, later meeting with them and New Jersey attorneys for Township of Mahwah to [REDACTED]	JM	4.10	\$350.00	\$1,435.00
09/13/2017	Met with E. Bechara re research findings.	BB	0.88	\$350.00	\$308.00
09/13/2017	Met with D. Goldberg, J. McGuire, B. Chewcaskle, M. Giacobbe, R. Gantner & J. Madden re [REDACTED]	BB	4.17	\$350.00	\$1,459.50
09/14/2017	Review of current [REDACTED]	BB	1.07	\$350.00	\$374.50
09/14/2017	Met with B. Black regarding arguments in support of [REDACTED]	EB	1.02	\$225.00	\$229.50
09/14/2017	Met with E. Bechara re [REDACTED] Assigned [REDACTED] research. Continued exploring ways to advance [REDACTED]	BB	2.11	\$350.00	\$738.50

12/25/2017

09/14/2017	Searched for [REDACTED] Created a list of this companies and emailed to E. Bechara as requested.	CM	0.95	\$110.00	\$104.50
09/15/2017	Call with R. Hermanson re [REDACTED]	BB	0.71	\$350.00	\$248.50
09/15/2017	Printed [REDACTED] Gave folder to E. Bechara as requested.	CM	0.89	\$110.00	\$87.90
09/19/2017	Further research on [REDACTED] and [REDACTED]	BB	0.34	\$350.00	\$119.00
09/20/2017	Called and emailed [REDACTED] [REDACTED] companies had questions I did not have answers to; asked E. Bechara and emailed B. Black.	CM	1.82	\$110.00	\$200.20
09/21/2017	Called Brian Chewcaskie. He was not in his office, left a voice mail. Spoke to J. Feeley over the phone regarding the [REDACTED]	CM	0.94	\$110.00	\$103.40
09/22/2017	Emailed B Chewcaskie. Forwarded some emails to B. Black. Emailed one of the [REDACTED]	CM	0.47	\$110.00	\$51.70
09/23/2017	Researched [REDACTED]	JF	1.40	\$110.00	\$154.00
09/25/2017	Researched issue of [REDACTED] Discussed with J. Feeley.	BB	0.74	\$350.00	\$259.00
09/25/2017	Phone call with B. Chewcaskie re [REDACTED]	BB	0.25	\$350.00	\$87.50
09/25/2017	Utilized Lexis and online resources to [REDACTED]	JF	1.81	\$110.00	\$177.10
09/26/2017	[REDACTED] research; considered both [REDACTED]	BB	2.43	\$350.00	\$850.50
09/26/2017	Researched and read opinions and decisions on [REDACTED]	JF	1.90	\$110.00	\$209.00
09/26/2017	Read case law on [REDACTED]	JF	0.71	\$110.00	\$78.10
09/26/2017	Meeting with B. Black and E. Bechara on research [REDACTED]	JF	2.00	\$110.00	\$220.00
09/26/2017	Meeting with B. Black and J.L. Feeley regarding [REDACTED]	EB	2.00	\$225.00	\$450.00

12/25/2017

09/26/2017	Researched [REDACTED]	JF	1.47	\$110.00	\$161.70
09/28/2017	Meeting with E. Bechara and J. Feeley regarding re [REDACTED]	BB	2.00	\$350.00	\$700.00
09/27/2017	Researched articles and cases for instances of [REDACTED]	JF	0.69	\$110.00	\$64.90
09/27/2017	Researched articles and cases of [REDACTED]	JF	1.25	\$110.00	\$137.50
09/27/2017	Read decisions and articles on [REDACTED]	JF	1.65	\$110.00	\$181.50
09/27/2017	Research on [REDACTED]	JF	1.38	\$110.00	\$151.80
09/27/2017	Researched and read articles on [REDACTED]	JF	0.40	\$110.00	\$44.00
09/27/2017	Researching [REDACTED]	EB	2.30	\$225.00	\$517.50
09/28/2017	Follow-up research on [REDACTED]	JF	0.80	\$110.00	\$88.00
09/28/2017	Meeting with B. Black and E. Bechara discussing [REDACTED]	JF	2.80	\$110.00	\$308.00
09/28/2017	Meeting with B. Black and J.L. Feeley regarding legal arguments [REDACTED]	EB	2.80	\$225.00	\$630.00
09/28/2017	Researched [REDACTED]	EB	2.50	\$225.00	\$562.50
09/28/2017	Meeting with E. Bechara and J.L. Feeley; reviewed research assignments; discussed [REDACTED]	BB	2.80	\$360.00	\$980.00
09/28/2017	Searched for important decisions related to [REDACTED]	CM	0.95	\$110.00	\$104.50
09/28/2017	Researched and read [REDACTED]	JF	2.10	\$110.00	\$231.00
09/29/2017	Research on [REDACTED]	JF	1.60	\$110.00	\$176.00
09/29/2017	Researched [REDACTED]	EB	2.10	\$225.00	\$472.50
10/02/2017	Meeting with E. Bechara re [REDACTED]	BB	0.17	\$350.00	\$59.50

OIC per
TUP A/ly

12/26/2017

10/02/2017	Researched and drafted memo Re: [REDACTED]	JF	3.06	\$350.00	\$1,071.00
10/02/2017	Research on [REDACTED]	BB	1.20	\$350.00	\$420.00
10/02/2017	Met with B. Black to discuss legal theories [REDACTED]; reviewed [REDACTED]	JN	0.81	\$350.00	\$283.50
10/02/2017	Meeting at HSG with J. McGuire.	BB	0.75	\$350.00	\$262.50
10/02/2017	Met with J. Nelson [REDACTED]	BB	0.81	\$350.00	\$283.50
10/03/2017	Phone call with J. McGuire, B. Chewcaskle, M. Glacobbé.	BB	1.29	\$350.00	\$451.50
10/03/2017	Meeting with E. Bechara re. [REDACTED]	BB	0.39	\$350.00	\$136.50
10/03/2017	Email to B.Chewcask seeking information regarding [REDACTED]	EB	0.12	\$225.00	\$27.00
10/03/2017	Called IEEE Institute to get information about the [REDACTED] left voice mail.	CM	0.12	\$110.00	\$13.20
10/04/2017	Researched additional [REDACTED] with B.Black,	EB	1.30	\$225.00	\$292.50
10/06/2017	Continued research on [REDACTED]	BB	2.75	\$350.00	\$962.50
10/08/2017	Research on and analysis of [REDACTED]	BB	1.01	\$350.00	\$353.50
10/09/2017	Continued researching [REDACTED] also explored and assigned to E. Bechara issues of [REDACTED]	BB	1.79	\$350.00	\$626.50
10/09/2017	Conducted extensive research task on [REDACTED] and discussed findings and research methodology with B.Black.	EB	4.50	\$225.00	\$1,012.50
10/10/2017	Researched new cases [REDACTED]	JF	1.72	\$110.00	\$189.20
10/10/2017	Drafted summary memo, [REDACTED]	BB	2.50	\$350.00	\$875.00
10/10/2017	Prepared for meeting with HSG.	EB	1.00	\$225.00	\$225.00

12/25/2017

10/10/2017	Meeting with B.Black, J. McGuire and M.Nelson [REDACTED]	EB	2.16	\$226.00	\$486.00
10/10/2017	Researched online [REDACTED]	JF	0.59	\$110.00	\$64.90
10/10/2017	Researched online [REDACTED]	JF	0.68	\$110.00	\$74.80
10/10/2017	Meeting with E. Bechara, J. McGuire and M.Nelson at HSG re forthcoming Township Council meeting and possible memo.	BB	2.16	\$350.00	\$756.00
10/11/2017	Researched online [REDACTED]	JF	1.04	\$110.00	\$114.40
10/11/2017	Researched online [REDACTED]	JF	1.25	\$110.00	\$137.50
10/11/2017	Researched articles on [REDACTED]	JF	2.32	\$350.00	\$812.00
10/12/2017	Researched [REDACTED]	JF	1.39	\$350.00	\$486.50
10/13/2017	Drafted memo [REDACTED]	JF	1.80	\$110.00	\$198.00
10/25/2017	Researched legal matters [REDACTED]	JF	1.05	\$110.00	\$115.50
10/26/2017	Further research on [REDACTED]	JF	0.95	\$110.00	\$107.80
11/01/2017	Discussed [REDACTED] with B. Black and J. Madden.	JN	1.00	\$350.00	\$350.00
11/01/2017	Met with J. Madden and J. Nelson to review status of matter and discuss [REDACTED]	BB	1.00	\$350.00	\$350.00
11/01/2017	Meeting with B. Black and J. Nelson to discuss [REDACTED]	JM	1.00	\$350.00	\$350.00
11/20/2017	Phone call with R. Hermansen re. Invitation received to attend tomorrow night's Township Council's meeting.	BB	0.69	\$350.00	\$206.50
11/30/2017	Phone call with client re [REDACTED]	BB	0.39	\$350.00	\$136.50
				Subtotal	\$34,798.30
				Total	\$34,798.30

see attached

12/25/2017

Detailed Statement of Account

Current Invoice

Invoice Number	Due On	Amount Due	Payments Received	Balance Due
282	01/24/2018	\$34,798.30	\$0.00	\$34,798.30
Outstanding Balance				\$34,798.30
Total Amount Outstanding				\$34,798.30

Please make all amounts payable to: Nelson Madden Black LLP

Please pay within 30 days.

Reflects activity through November 2017.

NELSON MADDEN BLACK LLP

5 Bryant Park, 27th Floor
 New York, New York 10018
 Telephone (212) 362-4300
 nelsonmaddenblack.com

INVOICE

Date: 02/26/2018
 Due On: 03/28/2018

Mahwah Township

00106-Mahwah Township:Eruv Litigation

Eruv Litigation

OK
 Per
 Att'y

Date	Notes	Initials	Time	Rate	Total
09/27/2017	Meeting with B.Black and J. Fealy regarding legal arguments pertaining to [REDACTED]	EB	2.00	\$225.00	\$450.00
10/11/2017	Researched [REDACTED]	JF	2.47	\$110.00	\$271.70
10/12/2017	Surveyed [REDACTED]	BB	4.50	\$350.00	\$1,675.00
01/22/2018	Conference call with counsel, proposed meeting with Eruv Assn. counsel.	BB	0.58	\$350.00	\$203.00
01/25/2018	Prepared for meeting with Township Council.	BB	0.59	\$350.00	\$206.50
01/25/2018	Phone-In conference with Township Council.	BB	0.39	\$350.00	\$136.50
01/26/2018	Conference calls with all counsel to review and revise [REDACTED]	BB	1.59	\$350.00	\$556.50
01/26/2018	Reviewed and edited [REDACTED]	BB	0.57	\$350.00	\$199.50
01/28/2018	Multiple emails with all counsel re [REDACTED]	BB	0.27	\$350.00	\$94.50
01/30/2018	Further email exchanges re [REDACTED]	BB	0.31		
01/30/2018	Call with Y. Buchwoltz re [REDACTED]	BB	0.27		

\$2296.70

2017

2018

0.0

1,575.00 +
 271.70 +
 450.00 +
 2,296.70 T

OK ✓

NELSON MADDEN BLACK LLP

5 Bryant Park, 27th Floor
 New York, New York 10018
 Telephone (212) 382-4300
 nelsonmaddenblack.com

INVOICE

Date: 02/28/2018
 Due On: 03/28/2018

Mahwah Township

00105-Mahwah Township:Eruv Litigation

Eruv Litigation

OK
 Per Top
 Atty

Date	Notes	Initials	Time	Rate	Total
09/27/2017	Meeting with B.Black and J.L. Feely regarding legal arguments pertaining [REDACTED]	EB	2.00	\$226.00	\$460.00
10/11/2017	Researched [REDACTED]	JF	2.47	\$110.00	\$271.70
10/12/2017	Surveyed [REDACTED]	BB	4.60	\$350.00	\$1,675.00
01/22/2018	Conference call with counsel, proposed meeting with Eruv Aasen, counsel.	BB	0.68	\$360.00	\$203.00
01/26/2018	Prepared for meeting with Township Council.	BB	0.59	\$350.00	\$206.50
01/26/2018	Phone-in conference with Township Council.	BB	0.39	\$350.00	\$136.50
01/26/2018	Conference calls with all counsel to review and revise [REDACTED]	BB	1.58	\$350.00	\$566.50
01/26/2018	Reviewed and edited [REDACTED]	BB	0.57	\$360.00	\$199.50
01/28/2018	Multiple emails with all counsel re [REDACTED]	BB	0.27	\$350.00	\$94.50
01/30/2018	Further email exchanges re [REDACTED]	BB	0.30	\$360.00	\$105.00
01/30/2018	Call with Y. Buchwetz re [REDACTED]	BB	0.27	\$350.00	\$94.50

} = \$2296.70
 2017
 2018



02/26/2018

02/06/2018	Conference call with all counsel re Town hall scheduled for tonight; upcoming meetings with Y. Buchwoltz; AG case status.	BB	0.49	\$350.00	\$171.50
02/23/2018	Meeting with BREa and Legal Counsel re: [REDACTED]	BB	3.00	\$350.00	\$1,050.00
				Subtotal	\$6,114.20
				Total	\$6,114.20

Statement of Account

Outstanding Balance	New Charges	Payments Received	Total Amount Outstanding
(\$34,788.30	+ \$5,114.20)-(\$0.00) = \$39,912.50

Please make all amounts payable to: Nelson Madden Black LLP

Please pay within 30 days.

	0.0		0.0
2017	450.00 +	Partner @ 3350	0.58 +
PO #	271.70 +		0.59 +
	1,575.00 +		0.39 +
	2,296.70 T		1.59 +
	0.0		0.57 +
		2018 portion	0.27 +
2018	5,114.20 +		0.30 +
PO #	2,296.70 -		0.27 +
	2,817.50 T		0.49 +
			3.00 +
			8.05 T
			8.05 x
			350.00 =
			2,817.50 *

2018 portion