

**BOGGIA & BOGGIA, L.L.C.
71 MOUNT VERNON STREET
RIDGEFIELD PARK, NEW JERSEY 07660
(201) 641-0006 - (201) 641-6649 (FAX)**

MONTVALE, BOROUGH OF
12 MERCEDES DRIVE
MONTVALE NJ 07645-1816

Page: 1
09/15/2017
File No.: 149400-207D
Bill No: 28116

MONTVALE - ERUV ORGANIZATION

FOR LEGAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH 08/31/2017

			<u>HOURS</u>	
08/01/2017	PNB	Review brief filed by attorney for association for ERUV litigation	0.70	
08/02/2017	JV	Review ERUV articles		n/c
08/14/2017	PNB	Review exhibits for pending litigation by Rockland ERUV Association	0.80	
TOTAL FEES FOR LEGAL SERVICES:			1.50	<u>210.00</u>

Recapitulation

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Total</u>
PHILIP N. BOGGIA	1.50	\$140.00	\$210.00

TOTAL BALANCE DUE

\$210.00

Aged Due Amounts

<u>0-30</u>	<u>31-60</u>	<u>61-90</u>	<u>91-120</u>	<u>121-180</u>	<u>181+</u>
210.00	714.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00

BOGGIA & BOGGIA, L.L.C.
71 MOUNT VERNON STREET
RIDGEFIELD PARK, NEW JERSEY 07660
(201) 641-0006 - (201) 641-6649 (FAX)

MONTVALE, BOROUGH OF
 12 MERCEDES DRIVE
 MONTVALE NJ 07645-1816

Page: 1
 08/11/2017
 File No.: 149400-207D
 Bill No: 28054

MONTVALE - ERUV ORGANIZATION

FOR LEGAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH 07/31/2017

		<u>HOURS</u>	
7/14/2017			
JV	Exchange e-mails with Maureen Iarossi-Alwan regarding ERUVs		n/c
JV	Phone conferences with Mayor regarding ERUVs	0.30	
JV	Legal research regarding ERUVs and list amendment concerns	0.50	
7/17/2017			
JV	Phone conferences with Robert Regan, Esq.	0.30	
JV	Review information regarding ERUVs	0.30	
7/20/2017			
JV	Review correspondence from ERUV group	0.30	
JV	Phone conference and e-mail exchanges with Mayor		n/c
JV	Legal internet research regarding ERUVs	0.80	
7/21/2017			
JV	Prepare and revise statement for Mayor	0.70	
JV	Preparation of e-mail to Mayor regarding ERUV		n/c
7/28/2017			
JV	Review research regarding ERUVs including law review articles and cases	1.20	
7/31/2017			
JV	Review brief and complaint regarding ERUV	0.70	
	TOTAL FEES FOR LEGAL SERVICES:	5.10	714.00

	Recapitulation	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Total</u>
<u>Timekeeper</u> JOSEPH VOYTUS		5.10	\$140.00	\$714.00

TOTAL BALANCE DUE **\$714.00**

BOGGIA & BOGGIA, L.L.C.
71 MOUNT VERNON STREET
RIDGEFIELD PARK, NEW JERSEY 07660
(201) 641-0006 - (201) 641-6649 (FAX)

MONTVALE, BOROUGH OF
 12 MERCEDES DRIVE
 MONTVALE NJ 07645-1816

Page: 1
 10/18/2017
 File No.: 149400-207D
 Bill No: 28214

MONTVALE - ERUV ORGANIZATION

FOR LEGAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH 09/29/2017

		<u>HOURS</u>	
9/12/2017	PNB	Conference with Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq. regarding Chestnut Ridge ERUV	0.60
	JV	Phone conference with Mayor Ghassali regarding ERUVs	n/c
	JV	Office conference with Philip N. Boggia, Esq. regarding Penn Ave. donations	0.20
9/14/2017	PNB	Conference with Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq. regarding ERUV litigation	0.60
	PNB	Conference with Brian Chewcaski, Esq. regarding litigation (ERUV)	0.50
	JV	Review e-mails and attachments with ERUV	0.40
9/15/2017	PNB	Preparation of reply correspondence to Yehuda Buckweitz, Esq. regarding possible litigation with ERUV Assoc.	0.50
9/18/2017	PNB	Phone call from Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq. regarding federal litigation regarding ERUV Assoc.	0.40
9/20/2017	PNB	Phone call from Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq. regarding ERUV Assoc. litigation	0.30
9/25/2017	PNB	Conference with Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq. regarding ERUV litigation	0.30
	JV	Phone conference with Robert Regan, Esq. regarding ERUV	n/c
9/27/2017	JV	Revise correspondence regarding ERUV	0.20
	JV	Phone conference with Mayor regarding ERUV	n/c
9/28/2017	PNB	Review correspondence from Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq. regarding ERUV litigation	0.50
	PNB	Research legal authorities regarding placement of ERUV	1.10
	JV	Revise e-mail to Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq.	0.30
	JV	Review information and e-mails from Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq.	0.20

MONTVALE - ERUV ORGANIZATION

File No.:
Bill No:

Page: 2
10/18/2017
149400-207D
28214

09/29/2017

PNB Review correspondence from Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq. regarding ERUV Assoc.
 PNB Review amended Complaint against Upper Saddle River
 JV Exchange e-mails with Mayor
 JV Exchange e-mails with Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq.

HOURS

0.30
0.70

n/c

TOTAL FEES FOR LEGAL SERVICES:

0.10
7.20

1,008.00

Recapitulation

Timekeeper
PHILIP N. BOGGIA
JOSEPH VOYTUS

Hours
5.80
1.40

Rate
\$140.00
140.00

Total
\$812.00
196.00

TOTAL BALANCE DUE

\$1,008.00

0-30
1,008.00

31-60
210.00

Aged Due Amounts
61-90
0.00

91-120
0.00

121-180
0.00

181+
0.00

n/c

n/c

BOGGIA & BOGGIA, L.L.C.
71 MOUNT VERNON STREET
RIDGEFIELD PARK, NEW JERSEY 07660
(201) 641-0006 - (201) 641-6649 (FAX)

MONTVALE, BOROUGH OF
 12 MERCEDES DRIVE
 MONTVALE NJ 07645-1816

Page: 1
 11/13/2017
 File No.: 149400-207D
 Bill No: 28319

MONTVALE - ERUV ORGANIZATION

FOR LEGAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH 10/31/2017

		<u>HOURS</u>	
10/02/2017	JV	Exchange e-mails regarding ERUV	n/c
10/03/2017	PNB	Review correspondence from Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq. regarding ERUV Assoc. and threatened litigation	0.30
	JV	Exchange e-mails regarding ERUV	0.20
10/05/2017	PNB	Review correspondence from Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq. regarding ERUV Assoc.	0.30
10/10/2017	PNB	Review correspondence from Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq. regarding Rockland ERUV Assoc.	0.70
	PNB	Review exhibits	0.50
	JV	Review correspondence from ERUV group	0.30
10/11/2017	PNB	Review documents from Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq. regarding ERUV Assoc.	0.70
	PNB	Review documents filed against Upper Saddle River to allow ERUV placed on utility poles	0.80
	PNB	Review revised area for location of ERUVs	0.70
	JV	Phone conference with Mayor Ghassali	
	JV	Phone conference with Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq.	0.30
10/18/2017	PNB	Conference with Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq. regarding preliminary injunction and Complaint for ERUV Assoc.	0.40
	PNB	Review requirements for preliminary injunction to allow placement of ERUVs	1.30
10/19/2017	PNB	Review Complaint filed in NJ District Court by ERUV Association	1.40
	PNB	Review exhibits to Complaint	0.70
	PNB	Review OPRA request from Nigor Sharkh regarding ERUV litigation	0.40
	PNB	Phone call from Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq. regarding pro hac vice and pending litigation	0.40

MONTVALE - ERUV ORGANIZATION

HOURS

10/20/2017				
PNB	Phone call from Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq. regarding ERUV litigation		0.30	
PNB	Review draft Answer to complaint and defenses to lawsuit		0.80	
11/23/2017				
PNB	Review correspondence from Orange and Rockland County utility poles, John Carley, Esq.		0.30	
PNB	Review agreement from Orange and Rockland County for ERUV Assoc.		0.70	
PNB	Review notice of Motion for order admitting pro hac vice		0.40	
PNB	Conference with Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq. regarding Complaint filed against the Borough		0.30	
12/25/2017				
PNB	Review lawsuit filed by state attorney general against Mahwah, NJ for blocking ERUVs		0.80	
1/26/2017				
PNB	Review legal brief filed by Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq. for ERUV Assoc.		0.80	
1/27/2017				
PNB	Review exhibits to Complaint regarding ERUV litigation		0.80	
PNB	Review proposed compromise for location of ERUVs on utility poles		0.70	
2/10/2017				
PNB	Review exhibits attached to complaint for ERUV litigation		0.80	
2/11/2017				
PNB	Conference with Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq. regarding proposal for new poles		0.40	
	TOTAL FEES FOR LEGAL SERVICES:		16.50	2,310.00

Recapitulation

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Total</u>
PHILIP N. BOGGIA	15.70	\$140.00	\$2,198.00
JOSEPH VOYTUS	0.80	140.00	112.00

TOTAL BALANCE DUE \$2,310.00

Aged Due Amounts

<u>0-30</u>	<u>31-60</u>	<u>61-90</u>	<u>91-120</u>	<u>121-180</u>	<u>181+</u>
3,318.00	210.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00

BOGGIA & BOGGIA, L.L.C.
71 MOUNT VERNON STREET
RIDGEFIELD PARK, NEW JERSEY 07660
(201) 641-0006 - (201) 641-6649 (FAX)

MONTVALE, BOROUGH OF
12 MERCEDES DRIVE
MONTVALE NJ 07645-1816

Page: 1
12/18/2017
File No.: 149400-207D
Bill No: 28381

MONTVALE - ERUV ORGANIZATION

FOR LEGAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH 11/30/2017

		<u>HOURS</u>
11/01/2017		
PNB	Conference with Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq. regarding alternative plan for placement of ERUVs on utility poles	0.50
PNB	Conference with John Carley, Esq., attorney for Orange & Rockland	0.40
11/02/2017		
PNB	Conference with Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq. regarding pending litigation	0.70
PNB	Conference with John Carley, Esq., Orange & Rockland Electric regarding alternate route for ERUVs	0.60
11/03/2017		
PNB	Conference with Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq. regarding proposed alternate route for ERUV	0.50
PNB	Review pending litigation documents	0.70
11/06/2017		
PNB	Attend meeting with Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq., rabbi and Borough officials regarding pending legal issues with ERUV	2.80
11/07/2017		
PNB	Preparation of request for extension to fill an Answer in federal litigation - ERUV	0.50
PNB	Review proposed settlement for pending ERUV Assoc. litigation	0.80
PNB	Review and revise construction and access easement	0.70
11/08/2017		
PNB	Conference with Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq. regarding proposed settlement for pending litigation	0.40
11/10/2017		
PNB	Phone call to Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq. regarding discussions on pending litigation	0.40
11/14/2017		
PNB	Review Order extending time to answer complaint for pending ERUV Assoc. litigation	0.70
11/27/2017		
PNB	Review correspondence from Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq. regarding	

MONTVALE - ERUV ORGANIZATION

pending litigation on ERUV	<u>HOURS</u>	
	0.40	
TOTAL FEES FOR LEGAL SERVICES:	10.10	<u>1,414.00</u>

Recapitulation

<u>Timekeeper</u>				
PHILIP N. BOGGIA	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>		<u>Total</u>
	10.10	\$140.00		\$1,414.00

TOTAL BALANCE DUE		<u>\$1,414.00</u>
-------------------	--	-------------------

BOGGIA & BOGGIA, L.L.C.
71 MOUNT VERNON STREET
RIDGEFIELD PARK, NEW JERSEY 07660
(201) 641-0006 - (201) 641-6649 (FAX)

MONTVALE, BOROUGH OF
12 MERCEDES DRIVE
MONTVALE NJ 07645-1816

Page: 1
01/17/2018
File No.: 149400-207D
Bill No: 28479

MONTVALE - ERUV ORGANIZATION

FOR LEGAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH 12/31/2017

		<u>HOURS</u>
12/04/2017		
PNB	Preparation of correspondence to Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq. regarding ERUV litigation	0.70
12/05/2017		
JV	Phone call with Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq. and Rabbi Steinmetz	0.30
12/06/2017		
PNB	Conference with Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq. regarding revisions to location of eruvs	0.50
12/07/2017		
PNB	Review information from Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq. regarding eruv litigation	0.70
12/08/2017		
PNB	Conference with Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq. regarding ERUV locations	0.50
12/12/2017		
PNB	Conference with Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq. regarding ERUV litigation and possible resolution of lawsuit	0.40
12/18/2017		
PNB	Conference with Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq. regarding placement location of ERUVs in Borough	0.30
12/20/2017		
PNB	Conference with Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq. regarding terms and conditions of settlement	0.30
12/21/2017		
PNB	Conference with Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq.	0.30
PNB	Review possible installation of fence and poles for settlement purposes	0.80
12/26/2017		
PNB	Conference with Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq. regarding discussion for settlement of pending litigation	0.40

MONTVALE - ERUV ORGANIZATION

		<u>HOURS</u>		
12/27/2017				
PNB	Review proposed terms of settlement for ERUV litigation	0.80		
PNB	Conference with Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq. regarding extension to file Answer	0.40		
12/28/2017				
PNB	Review stipulation extending time to answer in pending ERUV litigation	0.50		
12/29/2017				
PNB	Review correspondence from Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq. regarding Stipulation extending time to answer	0.40		
PNB	Review and revise settlement proposal	0.70		
PNB	Conference with Robert McNerney's office regarding A&P tax appeal; review proposed tax settlement	0.70		
TOTAL FEES FOR LEGAL SERVICES:		<u>8.70</u>	<u>1,218.00</u>	

Recapitulation

Timekeeper	Hours	Rate	Total
PHILIP N. BOGGIA	8.40	\$140.00	\$1,176.00
JOSEPH VOYTUS	0.30	140.00	42.00

TOTAL BALANCE DUE

\$1,218.00

Aged Due Amounts

<u>0-30</u>	<u>31-60</u>	<u>61-90</u>	<u>91-120</u>	<u>121-180</u>	<u>181+</u>
2,632.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00

BOGGIA & BOGGIA, L.L.C.
71 MOUNT VERNON STREET
RIDGEFIELD PARK, NEW JERSEY 07660
(201) 641-0006 - (201) 641-6649 (FAX)

MONTVALE, BOROUGH OF
 12 MERCEDES DRIVE
 MONTVALE NJ 07645-1816

Page: 1
 01/17/2018
 File No.: 149400-271D
 Bill No: 28492

BREA v. Montvale

FOR LEGAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH 12/31/2017

		<u>HOURS</u>	
12/04/2017	JV	Exchange emails with Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq.	n/c
12/05/2017	JV	Phone call to Mayor Ghassali	n/c
	JV	Phone call with Mayor Ghassali regarding ERUV	n/c
12/06/2017	JV	Perform survey of existing poles in Montvale in order to prepare map showing existing poles and proposed ERUV boundary for Council	1.10
	JV	Draft map showing poles, ERUV boundaries, fences and alternative ERUV boundaries	1.20
	JV	Preparation of email to Mayor Ghassali and Andy Hipolit regarding map	n/c
	JV	Phone call with Andy Hipolit	n/c
12/07/2017	JV	Phone conference with Michael Nagelberg	0.10
	JV	Exchange e-mails with Michael Nagelberg	0.30
	JV	Exchange e-mails with Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq. regarding phone conference	0.20
	JV	Exchange correspondence with Mayor	n/c
	JV	Preparation of e-mail to Michael Nagelberg	0.10
12/08/2017	JV	Phone conference with Andy Hipolit	n/c
	JV	Exchange e-mails with Debbie Wood	n/c
12/11/2017	JV	Review subpoena response from Narita	0.80
	JV	Exchange e-mails with Narita	n/c
	JV	Listen to tapes on ERUV issue	1.20
	JV	Legal research regarding ERUV litigation	1.10
	JV	Office conference with Philip N. Boggia, Esq. regarding ERUV	n/c
12/12/2017	JV	Phone conferences with Mayor	n/c
	JV	Phone conference with Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq.	0.30
	JV	Exchange e-mails with Mayor	n/c
	JV	Review e-mail from Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq.	0.10

BOGGIA & BOGGIA, L.L.C.
71 MOUNT VERNON STREET
RIDGEFIELD PARK, NEW JERSEY 07660
(201) 641-0006 - (201) 641-6649 (FAX)

MONTVALE, BOROUGH OF
 12 MERCEDES DRIVE
 MONTVALE NJ 07645-1816

Page: 1
 11/13/2017
 File No.: 149400-271D
 Bill No: 28330

BREA v. Montvale

FOR LEGAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH 10/31/2017

		<u>HOURS</u>	
0/19/2017			
JV	Review Complaint	0.20	
JV	Review OPRA request	0.20	
JV	Review correspondence	0.10	
0/23/2017			
JV	Review correspondence regarding ERUV lawsuit		n/c
JV	Office conference with Philip N. Boggia, Esq. regarding O&R		n/c
0/24/2017			
JV	Review Complaint and article against Montvale		n/c
JV	Preparation of e-mail to Mayor		n/c
0/25/2017			
JV	Phone conference with Mayor Ghassali		n/c
0/31/2017			
JV	Office conference with Philip N. Boggia, Esq. regarding ERUV	0.20	
JV	Review text from Mayor regarding ERUV		n/c
	TOTAL FEES FOR LEGAL SERVICES:	0.70	98.00

Recapitulation

	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Total</u>
<u>Timekeeper</u> JOSEPH VOYTUS	0.70	\$140.00	\$98.00

TOTAL BALANCE DUE

\$98.00

BOGGIA & BOGGIA, L.L.C.
71 MOUNT VERNON STREET
RIDGEFIELD PARK, NEW JERSEY 07660
(201) 641-0006 - (201) 641-6649 (FAX)

MONTVALE, BOROUGH OF
 12 MERCEDES DRIVE
 MONTVALE NJ 07645-1816

Page: 1
 12/18/2017
 File No.: 149400-271D
 Bill No: 28394

BREA v. Montvale

FOR LEGAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH 11/30/2017

		<u>HOURS</u>	
11/01/2017			
	JV	Review ERUV routes; preparation of maps	0.30
	JV	Phone conferences with Mayor Ghassali	n/c
11/02/2017			
	JV	Phone conference with Mayor	n/c
	JV	Revise e-mail to Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq.	0.10
	JV	Review response e-mail from Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq.	0.10
11/03/2017			
	JV	Review Complaint; mark locations of plaintiffs on map to determine how to address moving the ERUV in settlement discussions	0.60
11/06/2017			
	JV	Attend meeting in Montvale regarding ERUV	2.50
	JV	Phone conference with Andy Hipolit	0.20
11/07/2017			
	JV	Phone conference with Andy Hipolit regarding ERUV	0.30
	JV	Phone conference with Mayor regarding ERUV	n/c
	JV	Phone conference with Andy Hipolit regarding ERUV	0.10
	JV	Review plan from Andy Hipolit regarding ERUV	0.10
	JV	Office conference with Philip N. Boggia, Esq. regarding ERUV	n/c
11/08/2017			
	JV	Review subpoena from State Attorney General	0.20
	JV	Attend meeting regarding ERUV	n/c
11/10/2017			
	JV	Attend meeting regarding ERUV	1.20
	JV	Review e-mail; preparation of agreement	0.10
	JV	Review e-mails from Mayor regarding subpoena	n/c
11/13/2017			
	JV	Exchange e-mails with Narita regarding NJAG subpoena responses	n/c
	JV	Review proposed revision to Hornrock height definition; exchange e-mails with Jeff Surenian, Esq. and Darlene Green	0.20
	JV	Phone conference with Darlene Green regarding Hornrock height definition	0.10

BREA v. Montvale

HOURS

JV	Review proposed new language from Jeff Surenian, Esq.; respond	0.10	
11/15/2017			
JV	Review documents from Narita and respond		n/c
1/20/2017			
JV	Review e-mails from Narita		n/c
1/22/2017			
JV	Exchange e-mails with Andy Hipolit regarding ERUV map	0.20	
JV	Phone conference with Andy Hipolit regarding ERUV map and review	0.20	
JV	Review revised ERUV map	0.10	
JV	Exchange e-mails with Mayor Ghassali regarding ERUV map		n/c
1/27/2017			
JV	Phone conference with Maureen Iarossi-Alwan regarding subpoena	0.20	
JV	Review subpoena respond and send e-mail to Narita with comments	0.80	
JV	Preparation of Stipulation extending time	0.30	
JV	Exchange e-mails with Yehudah Buckweitz, Esq.	0.20	
JV	Revise Stipulation and file in Federal Court	0.20	
JV	Review e-mails regarding subpoena responses; exchange e-mails		n/c
JV	Office conference with Philip N. Boggia, Esq. regarding subpoena		n/c
JV	Review e-mail from Philip N. Boggia, Esq.		n/c
	TOTAL FEES FOR LEGAL SERVICES:	8.40	1,176.00

Recapitulation

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Total</u>
JOSEPH VOYTUS	8.40	\$140.00	\$1,176.00

TOTAL BALANCE DUE

\$1,176.00