

Purchase Requisition

Date: 9/13/17

P.O. #: 17-1815

VENDOR NO.: \_\_\_\_\_

VENDOR NAME: Chill Harbor & Seidel LLP

ADDRESS: 80 Pine Street

CITY/STATE: NY, NY 10005

ZIP: \_\_\_\_\_

ESTIMATE
CONFIRMING ORDER

1. Describe items or services fully, using catalog numbers where applicable.
2. Include estimated cost with delivery.
3. For requests which exceed \$1,000.00, 3 quotes are required. Please complete the bottom section as necessary of this page.
4. For requests which exceed \$11,700.00, sealed bids are required.
5. Verification of available funds must be made prior to any purchase.

QUOTES: 3120

1	Vendor:	<u>212-701-3000</u>
	Price:	_____
2	Vendor:	<u>- 3679</u>
	Price:	_____
3	Vendor:	_____
	Price:	_____

**THIS IS NOT AN AUTHORIZATION TO PURCHASE**

SPECIAL INSTRUCTIONS:

If awarded under state contract:  
STATE CONTRACT #: \_\_\_\_\_

ITEM	QTY	UNIT	ACCOUNT	DESCRIPTION	AMOUNT
1			<u>Litigation</u>	<u>Special Counsel</u> <u>(Erw lawsuit)</u> <u>Letrise - Joel Kurtzberg Esq.</u>	<u>20,000.-</u>
<b>TOTAL</b>					<u>20,000.-</u>

Fully explain if unable to obtain and/or it an emergency had arisen.

\_\_\_\_\_  
 \_\_\_\_\_  
 \_\_\_\_\_

Department Head Signature <u>[Signature]</u>	Chairperson Signature for budget revisions	CFO Certification of Funds
---	--	----------------------------

FED. TAX ID NO. 13-5510029

BOROUGH OF UPPER SADDLE RIVER, NJ

WIRE TRANSFER  
CITIBANK, NA, 153 EAST 53RD STREET, N.Y., N.Y. 10022  
ABA #021000089  
CAHILL GORDON & REINDEL LLP  
A/C #6780031250

BILL NO.

253556

CAHILL GORDON & REINDEL LLP  
EIGHTY PINE STREET  
NEW YORK, N.Y. 10005-1702

September 13, 2017

Re: ERUV DISPUTE

As per the Engagement Letter, \$20,000 initial retainer will be  
applied to all invoices on the Eruv litigation..... \$ 20,000.00

# BOROUGH OF UPPER SADDLE RIVER

376 WEST SADDLE RIVER ROAD • UPPER SADDLE RIVER, NJ 07458

TEL (201) 327-2196 • FAX (201) 934-5127

## PURCHASE ORDER

THIS NUMBER MUST APPEAR ON ALL INVOICES,  
PACKING LISTS, CORRESPONDENCE, ETC.

No. 17001815

Pg 1

SHIP TO

LEGAL

VENDOR

VENDOR #: CAHIL005

CAHILL GORDON & REINDEL LLP  
80 PINE STREET  
NEW YORK, NY 10005

ORDER DATE: 11/16/17  
REQUISITION NO:  
DELIVERY DATE:  
STATE CONTRACT:  
F.O.B. TERMS:

**FOR PAYMENT CONSIDERATION VOUCHER  
MUST BE RECEIVED BY THE FINANCE OFFICE  
BY THE FIRST OF EVERY MONTH.**

TAX EXEMPT NO. 22-6002356.

ALL INVOICES AND CORRESPONDENCE MUST BE SENT TO ABOVE ADDRESS REGARDLESS OF SHIPPING POINT.

QTY/UNIT	DESCRIPTION	ACCOUNT NO.	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL COST
1.00	ERUV LITIGATION RETAINER	7-01-20-712-278	20,000.0000	20,000.00
			TOTAL	20,000.00

### CERTIFICATION OF FUNDS

I hereby certify the funds are available and encumbered.

FINANCE DEPARTMENT

DATE

### RIGHT TO KNOW LABELING

All containers, including shipping cartons, shall bear a label indicating the chemical name(s) and Chemical Abstracts Service number(s) of all hazardous substances in the container, and all other substances which are among the five most predominant substances in the container, or their trade secret registry number. (N.J.A.C. 8:59-5). "Container" means a receptacle used to hold a liquid, solid or gaseous substance such as bottles, bags, barrels, boxes, cans, cylinders, drums and shipping cartons. (N.J.A.C. 8:59-1.3).



FED. TAX ID NO. 13-5510029

WIRE TRANSFER

CITIBANK, NA, 153 EAST 53RD STREET, N.Y., N.Y. 10022

ABA #021000089

CAHILL GORDON & REINDEL LLP

A/C #6780031250

BOROUGH OF UPPER SADDLE RIVER, NJ

BILL NO.

255458

CAHILL GORDON & REINDEL LLP

EIGHTY PINE STREET

NEW YORK, N.Y. 10005-1702

November 9, 2017

Re: ERUV DISPUTE

For professional services rendered in connection with the ERUV DISPUTE matter during the period ended October 31, 2017.....	\$	32,706.00
Disbursements and charges .....		323.85
TOTAL	\$	<u>33,029.85</u>

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

<u>DATE</u>	<u>NAME</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
09/08/17	Kurtzberg, J	Emails and tel. conf. w/ Bruce Rosen re: litigation status and strategy.	0.50
09/14/17	Kurtzberg, J	Review and analysis of amended complaint and emails w/ Bruce Rosen, Marci Hamilton, and team concerning same (0.2).	0.20
09/15/17	Kurtzberg, J	Review and analysis of amended complaint and documents/memos (0.2).	0.20
09/18/17	Kurtzberg, J	Review and analysis of amended complaint and documents/memos (0.6).	0.60
09/20/17	Kurtzberg, J	Tel. conf. w/ Bruce Rosen, Allison Zsamba, Marci Hamilton, and Robert Regan re: PI papers and response to amended complaint (0.8).	0.80
09/26/17	Kurtzberg, J	Review and analysis of memo re: factual assertions in Complaint and responses thereto (0.2).	0.20
09/27/17	Kurtzberg, J	Tel. conf. w/ Vinny Durante, Jon Ditkoff, Bruce Rosen, and Robert Regan re: litigation status and strategy (0.7); tel. conf. w/ Bruce Rosen, Allison Zsamba, Alicyn, Criag, Marci Hamilton, and Robert Regan re: same (0.3).	1.00
10/04/17	Kurtzberg, J	Emails and tel. conf. w/ Bruce Rosen, Alicyn Craig, and Allison Zsamba re: litigation strategy and re: potential motions to dismiss and motions for summary judgment (0.5); review and analysis of pleadings in connection w/ potential motion to dismiss on standing (0.2).	0.70
10/11/17	Kurtzberg, J	Review and analysis of PI papers (0.8); tel. conf. and emails w/ Bruce Rosen, Marci Hamilton, and re: response to PI papers (0.3)	1.10
10/16/17	Moon, B	Document Production for J. Kurtzberg.	0.50
10/17/17	Kurtzberg, J	Review and analysis of draft motion to dismiss and memos concerning standing and Iqbal/Twombly arguments	0.40
10/19/17	Kurtzberg, J	Drafted/edited motion to dismiss and review and analysis of pleadings and documents in connection w/	1.40

<u>DATE</u>	<u>NAME</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
		same (1.4).	
10/20/17	Kurtzberg, J	Drafted/edited motion to dismiss and review and analysis of pleadings and documents in connection w/ same (0.9).	0.90
10/23/17	Kurtzberg, J	Emails and telephone conference with Bruce Rosen, Marci Hamilton, Allison Zsamba, Alicyn Craig, and Bob Regan re: motion to dismiss and response to PI motion (0.4); drafted/edited motion to dismiss (3.5).	3.90
10/24/17	Kurtzberg, J	Drafted/edited motion to dismiss and emails w/ team concerning same (0.8); emails w/ Marci Hamilton, Bruce Rosen, Allison Zsamba, Alicyn Craig, Bob Regan, and Cindy Chen re: draft MTD brief and re: State's complaint against Mahwah (0.1).	0.90
10/25/17	Kurtzberg, J	Tel. conf. w/ Vincent Durante, Jon Ditkoff, Bruce Rosen, Marci Hamilton, and Bob Regan re: litigation strategy and case status (0.5).	0.50
10/27/17	Kurtzberg, J	Drafted/edited declaration of Robert Regan and emails w/ team concerning same (0.5); tel. conf. and emails w/ Bruce Rosen, Marci Hamilton, Cindy Chen, and Bob Regan re: same and re: PI papers (0.3); drafted/edited PI declarations (0.3).	1.10
10/27/17	Moon, B	Document Production for J. Kurtzberg.	0.50
10/27/17	Storm, M	Document Production for J. Kurtzberg	0.50
10/28/17	Kurtzberg, J	Drafted/edited PI declarations and emails w/ Bruce Rosen, Marci Hamilton, Allison Zsamba, Alicyn Craig, and Bob Regan re: same.	3.70
10/29/17	Kurtzberg, J	Drafted/edited PI declarations and emails w/ Bruce Rosen, Marci Hamilton, Allison Zsamba, Alicyn Craig, and Bob Regan re: same (0.3); drafted/edited motion to dismiss and emails and tel. conf. w/ Bruce Rosen, Marci Hamilton, Allison Zsamba, Alicyn Craig, and Bob Regan re: same (3.3).	3.60
10/30/17	Kurtzberg, J	Drafted/edited motion to dismiss and emails w/ Bruce Rosen, Marci Hamilton, Allison Zsamba, Alicyn Craig, and Bob Regan re: same (0.9); tel. conf. w/ Bruce Rosen re: same and re: PI papers (0.2).	1.10
10/31/17	Kurtzberg, J	Drafted/edited PI brief and counterstatement of facts and emails w/ Bruce Rosen, Marci Hamilton, Allison	5.30

<u>DATE</u>	<u>NAME</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
		Zsamba, Alicyn Craig, and Bob Regan re: same (4.9); drafted/edited pro hac vice papers and emails w/ Bruce Rosen's office concerning same (0.2); drafted/edited map graphic for PI papers and emails and tel. confs. w/ Michael Sullivan re: same (0.2).	
10/31/17	Sullivan, M	Tel.c. with Kurtzberg regarding options to create a map of USR and surrounding areas and edit to overlay Eruv boundaries and related information; coordinate with Emond regarding drafting map with overlays and better quality than handwritten map received to be included in a brief per Kurtzberg; various edits to map and emails with Kurtzberg.	2.00
10/31/17	Emond, N	Prepare draft annotated map per M. Sullivan. Correspond and confer with Sullivan regarding graphics.	2.00
10/31/17	Storm, M	Document Production for J. Kurtzberg	1.50
TOTAL TIME			35.10

-----TIME RECAP-----

<u>NAME</u>	<u>RATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
Kurtzberg, J	1080.00	28.10	30,348.00
Sullivan, M	512.00	2.00	1,024.00
Emond, N	364.00	2.00	728.00
Moon, B	202.00	1.00	202.00
Storm, M	202.00	2.00	404.00
TOTAL		35.10	\$32,706.00

DISBURSEMENTS AND CHARGES

AMOUNT

Reproduction	31.35
Word Processing	292.50
Total Disbursements	\$323.85



**BOROUGH OF UPPER SADDLE RIVER**  
 376 WEST SADDLE RIVER ROAD • UPPER SADDLE RIVER, NJ 07458  
 TEL (201) 327-2196 • FAX (201) 934-5127

PURCHASE ORDER	
THIS PURCHASE ORDER IS VALID FOR ALL INVOICES FOR PACKING LIST AND CORRESPONDENCE, ETC.	
No.	17001816

Pg 1

SHIP TO	LEGAL
	VENDOR # : CAHIL005 CAHILL GORDON & REINDEL LLP 80 PINE STREET NEW YORK, NY 10005

ORDER DATE: 11/16/17  
 REQUISITION NO:  
 DELIVERY DATE:  
 STATE CONTRACT:  
 F.O.B. TERMS:

**FOR PAYMENT CONSIDERATION VOUCHER  
 MUST BE RECEIVED BY THE FINANCE OFFICE  
 BY THE FIRST OF EVERY MONTH.**

TAX EXEMPT NO. 22-6002356.

ALL INVOICES AND CORRESPONDENCE MUST BE SENT TO ABOVE ADDRESS REGARDLESS OF SHIPPING POINT.

QTY/UNIT	DESCRIPTION	ACCOUNT NO.	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL COST
1.00	ERUV LITIGATION	7-01-20-712-278	33,029.8500	33,029.85
			TOTAL	33,029.85

**SIGN  
 HERE**

**CLAIMANT'S CERTIFICATION AND DECLARATION**

I do solemnly declare and certify under the penalties of perjury that the within bill is correct in all its particulars; that the articles have been furnished or services rendered as stated therein; that no bonus has been given or received by any person or persons with the knowledge of this claimant in connection with the above claim; that the amount therein stated is justly due and owing; and that the amount charged is a reasonable one.

ARE YOU INCORPORATED?

YES  NO

SIGNATURE: *Joel K...* DATE: 11/17 FED I.D. # OR SOC. SEC. #

**CERTIFICATION OF FUNDS**

I hereby certify the funds are available and encumbered.

FINANCE DEPARTMENT: *[Signature]* DATE

**APPROVAL FOR PAYMENT CONSIDERATION**

**COMMITTEE APPROVAL**

**BOROUGH EMPLOYEE CERTIFICATION**

MUNICIPAL ADMINISTRATOR \_\_\_\_\_ DATE \_\_\_\_\_

COMMITTEE CHAIRPERSON \_\_\_\_\_ DATE \_\_\_\_\_  
 COMMITTEE PERSON \_\_\_\_\_ DATE \_\_\_\_\_  
 COMMITTEE PERSON \_\_\_\_\_ DATE \_\_\_\_\_  
 COMMITTEE PERSON \_\_\_\_\_ DATE \_\_\_\_\_

I certify that the materials and supplies have been received or the services rendered; and further certify that the above pricing is correct as invoiced.

DEPARTMENT HEAD SIGNATURE \_\_\_\_\_ DATE \_\_\_\_\_

**VOUCHER COPY - SIGN AT X AND RETURN FOR PAYMENT • YOUR INVOICE MUST ACCOMPANY VOUCHER**



FED. TAX ID NO. 13-5510029

BOROUGH OF UPPER SADDLE RIVER, NJ

WIRE TRANSFER  
CITIBANK, NA, 158 EAST 53RD STREET, N.Y., N.Y. 10022  
ABA #021000089  
CAHILL GORDON & REINDEL LLP  
A/C #6780031250

BILL NO.

257029

CAHILL GORDON & REINDEL LLP  
EIGHTY PINE STREET  
NEW YORK, N.Y. 10005-1702  
December 6, 2017

Re: ERUV DISPUTE

For professional services rendered in connection with the ERUV DISPUTE matter during the period ended November 30, 2017 .....	\$	9,376.00
Disbursements and charges .....		111.10
TOTAL	\$	<u>9,487.10</u>

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

<u>DATE</u>	<u>NAME</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
11/01/17	Kurtzberg, J	Drafted/edited PI brief and counterstatement of facts and emails w/ Bruce Rosen, Marci Hamilton, Allison Zsamba, Alicyn Craig, and Bob Regan re: same (3.7) drafted/edited map graphic for PI papers and emails and tel. confs. w/ Michael Sullivan, Bruce Rosen, Allison Zsamba, and Alicyn Craig re: same (0.3); tel. conf. w/ Bruce Rosen, Allison Zsamba, Jon Ditkoff, Vinny Durante, Robert Regan, and Marci Hamilton re: litigation strategy (0.3).	4.30
11/01/17	Sullivan, M	Review of new draft of map from Emond and make various adjustments and fine tune items on map for better legibility and to identify appropriate boundaries and send to Kurtzberg; teleconference with Kurtzberg and Zsamba regarding changes and additions to map; various revisions to map and investigate options to overlay city boarders; send to Kurtzberg and Zsamba.	2.50
11/02/17	Kurtzberg, J	Emails w/ Bruce Rosen, Marci Hamilton, Allison Zsamba, Alicyn Craig, and Bob Regan re: PI papers and finalization of same.	0.20
11/02/17	Sullivan, M	Coordinate with Emond regarding options to overlay USR city boarders on map and review and revise and format various points and send to Kurtzberg and Zsamba; teleconference with Zsamba regarding many revisions to map, including changes to borders and re-labeling areas and review zoning map sent by Zsamba for USR borders not matching Google maps; make all changes to map per Zsamba and coordinate with Emond regarding revisions to certain boarder points under layers; review and finalize map and send to team.	3.00
11/02/17	Emond, N	Correspond and confer with Sullivan regarding update to graphics. Prepare revised map per Sullivan.	2.00
11/09/17	Kurtzberg, J	Emails w/ Bruce Rosen, Yehudah Buchweitz, Marci Hamilton, and Bob Regan re: briefing schedule for PI and MTD and proposed stipulation concerning same (0.1); emails w/ Cindy Chen and Marci Hamilton re: pro hac vice papers (0.1).	0.20

<u>DATE</u>	<u>NAME</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
11/13/17	Kurtzberg, J	Emails w/ Bruce Rosen, Bob Regan, Marci Hamilton, Alicyn Craig, and Allison Zsamba re: communications w/ Verizon about Plaintiffs' request for consent to attach lechis to utility poles (0.1); drafted/edited letter to Verizon re: same and emails w/ team about same (0.3).	0.40
11/15/17	Kurtzberg, J	Review and analysis of letter from Verizon re: application for consent to attach lechis and emails w/ Bruce Rosen, Bob Regan, and Marci Hamilton re: same (0.1).	0.10
11/17/17	Kurtzberg, J	Review and analysis of letter from Jonathan Gartner to Bruce Rosen re: communications w/ Verizon about consenting to eruv (0.1); emails w/ Bruce Rosen, Robert Regan, Marci Hamilton, Alicyn Craig, Allison Zsamba, and Cindy Chen re: same (0.1).	0.20
TOTAL TIME			12.90

-----TIME RECAP-----

<u>NAME</u>	<u>RATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
Kurtzberg, J	1080.00	5.40	5,832.00
Sullivan, M	512.00	5.50	2,816.00
Emond, N	364.00	2.00	728.00
TOTAL		12.90	\$9,376.00

DISBURSEMENTS AND CHARGES

	<u>AMOUNT</u>
Air Freight Delivery Charge	21.70
Reproduction	89.40
Total Disbursements	\$111.10

# BOROUGH OF UPPER SADDLE RIVER

376 WEST SADDLE RIVER ROAD • UPPER SADDLE RIVER, NJ 07458  
 TEL (201) 327-2196 • FAX (201) 934-5127

## PURCHASE ORDER

THE NUMBER OF APPEARANCES ON ALL INVOICES  
 PACKING LISTS, CORRESPONDENCE, ETC.

17001936

No.

ORDER DATE: 12/11/17  
 REQUISITION NO:  
 DELIVERY DATE:  
 STATE CONTRACT:  
 F.O.B. TERMS:

Pg 1

SHIP TO	LEGAL
	VENDOR

VENDOR #: CAHIL005  
 CAHILL GORDON & REINDEL LLP  
 80 PINE STREET  
 NEW YORK, NY 10005

**FOR PAYMENT CONSIDERATION VOUCHER  
 MUST BE RECEIVED BY THE FINANCE OFFICE  
 BY THE FIRST OF EVERY MONTH.**

TAX EXEMPT NO. 22-6002356.

ALL INVOICES AND CORRESPONDENCE MUST BE SENT TO ABOVE ADDRESS REGARDLESS OF SHIPPING POINT.

QTY/UNIT	DESCRIPTION	ACCOUNT NO.	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL COST
1.00	LITIGATION - ERUV	7-01-46-870-000	9,487.1000	9,487.10
			TOTAL	9,487.10

### CLAIMANT'S CERTIFICATION AND DECLARATION

I do solemnly declare and certify under the penalties of law that the within bill is correct in all its particulars; that the articles have been furnished or services rendered as stated therein; that no bonus has been given or received by any person or persons with the knowledge of this claimant in connection with the above claim; that the amount therein stated is justly due and owing; and that the amount charged is a reasonable one.

ARE YOU INCORPORATED?

YES  NO

SIGNATURE: *Joel K...* DATE: 12/15/17  
 FED I.D. # OR SOC. SEC. #

### CERTIFICATION OF FUNDS

I hereby certify the funds are available and encumbered.

FINANCE DEPARTMENT: *[Signature]* DATE

### APPROVAL FOR PAYMENT CONSIDERATION

### COMMITTEE APPROVAL

### BOROUGH EMPLOYEE CERTIFICATION

MUNICIPAL ADMINISTRATOR \_\_\_\_\_ DATE \_\_\_\_\_

COMMITTEE CHAIRPERSON \_\_\_\_\_ DATE \_\_\_\_\_  
 COMMITTEE PERSON \_\_\_\_\_ DATE \_\_\_\_\_  
 COMMITTEE PERSON \_\_\_\_\_ DATE \_\_\_\_\_  
 COMMITTEE PERSON \_\_\_\_\_ DATE \_\_\_\_\_

I certify that the materials and supplies have been received or the services rendered; and further certify that the above pricing is correct as invoiced.

DEPARTMENT HEAD SIGNATURE \_\_\_\_\_ DATE \_\_\_\_\_

Purchase Requisition

Date: 1/22/18

P.O. #: \_\_\_\_\_

VENDOR NO.: \_\_\_\_\_

VENDOR NAME: Phill Gordon & Bendel

ADDRESS: 80. Erie St.

CITY/STATE: NY . NY

ZIP: 10005

ESTIMATE
CONFIRMING ORDER

1. Describe items or services fully, using catalog numbers where applicable.
2. Include estimated cost with delivery.
3. For requests which exceed \$1,000.00, 3 quotes are required. Please complete the bottom section as necessary of this page.
4. For requests which exceed \$11,700.00, sealed bids are required.
5. Verification of available funds must be made prior to any purchase.

QUOTES:

- 1 Vendor: \_\_\_\_\_  
Price: \_\_\_\_\_
- 2 Vendor: \_\_\_\_\_  
Price: \_\_\_\_\_
- 3 Vendor: \_\_\_\_\_  
Price: \_\_\_\_\_

**FILE COPY**

**THIS IS NOT AN AUTHORIZATION TO PURCHASE**

If awarded under state contract:

SPECIAL INSTRUCTIONS:

STATE CONTRACT #: \_\_\_\_\_

ITEM	QTY	UNIT	ACCOUNT	DESCRIPTION	AMOUNT
1			Litigation	Legal Services Joel Kurtzberg, Esq (Error)	8,195.83
<b>TOTAL</b>					<b>8,195.83</b>

Fully explain if unable to obtain and/or it an emergency had arisen.

Department Head Signature <u>Joel Kurtzberg</u>	Chairperson Signature for budget revisions	CFO Certification of Funds
--	--	----------------------------

BOROUGH OF UPPER SADDLE RIVER, NJ

FED. TAX ID NO. 13-5510029

WIRE TRANSFER  
CITIBANK, NA, 158 EAST 53RD STREET, N.Y., N.Y. 10022  
ABA #021000089  
CAHILL GORDON & REINDEL LLP  
A/C #6780031250

BILL NO.

257716

CAHILL GORDON & REINDEL LLP  
EIGHTY PINE STREET  
NEW YORK, N.Y. 10005-1702

January 19, 2018

JAN 22 2018

Re: ERUV DISPUTE

For professional services rendered in connection with the ERUV DISPUTE matter during the period ended December 31, 2017 .....	\$	7,992.00
Disbursements and charges .....		203.85
TOTAL	\$	<u>8,195.85</u>



FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

<u>DATE</u>	<u>NAME</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
12/05/17	Kurtzberg, J	Review and analysis of Plaintiffs' PI and MTD papers (0.6); emails w/ Bruce Rosen, Marci Hamilton, Bob Regan, Alicyn Craig, and Ted Preusch re: same (0.1).	0.70
12/06/17	Kurtzberg, J	Tel. confs. w/ Bruce Rosen, Bob Regan, Jon Ditkoff, and Vincent Durante re: PI and MTD reply papers (0.8); review and analysis of Plaintiffs' PI declarations and briefs (0.1).	0.90
12/07/17	Kurtzberg, J	Review and analysis of Plaintiffs' PI declarations and briefs (0.5); drafted/edited outline of arguments for MTD reply brief.	0.40
12/08/17	Kurtzberg, J	Tel. conf. w/ Bruce Rosen re: PI/MTD reply brief (0.2); emails w/ Bruce Rosen, Marci Hamilton, Alicyn Craig, and Bob Regan re: exhaustion requirement in 1983 cases and legal research concerning same (0.2).	0.40
12/10/17	Kurtzberg, J	Emails w/ Bruce Rosen, Marci Hamilton, Bob Regan, Alicyn Craig, Allison Zsamba, and Cindy Chen re: PI/MTD reply brief and supplemental declarations (0.1).	0.10
12/11/17	Kurtzberg, J	Emails w/ Bruce Rosen, Marci Hamilton, Bob Regan, Alicyn Craig, Allison Zsamba, and Cindy Chen re: PI/MTD reply brief and supplemental declarations (0.1); drafted/edited same (4.5).	4.60
12/15/17	Kurtzberg, J	Review and analysis of supplemental authority letter from Diane Sullivan to Judge Vazquez and emails w/ team re: same (0.1).	0.10
12/18/17	Kurtzberg, J	Emails w/ Bruce Rosen re: oral argument and review of order concerning same (0.1).	0.10
12/21/17	Kurtzberg, J	Tel. conf. and emails w/ Bruce Rosen re: prep. for PI hearing.	0.10
TOTAL TIME			7.40

-----TIME RECAP-----

<u>NAME</u>	<u>RATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
Kurtzberg, J	1080.00	7.40	7,992.00
TOTAL		<u>7.40</u>	<u>\$7,992.00</u>

DISBURSEMENTS AND CHARGES

	<u>AMOUNT</u>
Reproduction	57.60
Word Processing	<u>146.25</u>
Total Disbursements	\$203.85

Date: 2/8/18

P.O. #: \_\_\_\_\_

VENDOR NO.: \_\_\_\_\_

VENDOR NAME: Cahill Gordon Reindel

ADDRESS: 153 E. 53 St.

CITY/STATE: NY, NY

ZIP: 10022

	ESTIMATE
	CONFIRMING ORDER

1. Describe items or services fully, using catalog numbers where applicable.
2. Include estimated cost with delivery.
3. For requests which exceed \$1,000.00, 3 quotes are required. Please complete the bottom section as necessary of this page.
4. For requests which exceed \$11,700.00, sealed bids are required.
5. Verification of available funds must be made prior to any purchase.

QUOTES:

- |   |         |       |
|---|---------|-------|
| 1 | Vendor: | _____ |
|   | Price:  | _____ |
| 2 | Vendor: | _____ |
|   | Price:  | _____ |
| 3 | Vendor: | _____ |
|   | Price:  | _____ |

**FILE COPY**

**THIS IS NOT AN AUTHORIZATION TO PURCHASE**

SPECIAL INSTRUCTIONS:

If awarded under state contract:

STATE CONTRACT #: \_\_\_\_\_

ITEM	QTY	UNIT	ACCOUNT	DESCRIPTION	AMOUNT
1			Legal Services	Litigation - Crav J. Kurtzberg, Esq	27,246.-
<b>TOTAL</b>					<b>27,246.-</b>

Fully explain if unable to obtain and/or it an emergency had arisen.


Department Head Signature <u>[Signature]</u>	Chairperson Signature for budget revisions	CFO Certification of Funds
---	--	----------------------------

FED. TAX ID NO. 13-5510029

BOROUGH OF UPPER SADDLE RIVER, NJ

WIRE TRANSFER  
CITIBANK, NA, 153 EAST 53RD STREET, N.Y., N.Y. 10022  
ABA #021000089  
CAHILL GORDON & REINDEL LLP  
A/C #6780031250

BILL NO.

257999

CAHILL GORDON & REINDEL LLP  
EIGHTY PINE STREET  
NEW YORK, N.Y. 10005-1702

February 7, 2018

---

Re: ERUV DISPUTE

For professional services rendered in connection with the ERUV DISPUTE matter during the period ended January 31, 2018 .....	\$	27,246.00
TOTAL	\$	<u>27,246.00</u>

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

<u>DATE</u>	<u>NAME</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
01/02/18	Kurtzberg, J	Emails w/ Bruce Rosen, Marci Hamilton, Bob Regan, and Alicyn Craig re: oral argument and re: memo concerning discriminatory intent (0.1); review and analysis of memo re: discriminatory intent (0.2).	0.30
01/03/18	Kurtzberg, J	Review and analysis of memo re: discriminatory intent and cases cited therein (0.2).	0.20
01/04/18	Kurtzberg, J	Review and analysis of cases, briefs, and pleadings in preparation for oral argument and drafted outline of argument (1.0); emails and tel. conf. w/ Bruce Rosen and Alicyn Craig re: prep. for oral argument (0.9).	1.90
01/05/18	Kurtzberg, J	Emails w/ Bruce Rosen, Robert Regan, and Alicyn Craig re: prep. for oral argument and communications w/ Judge Vasquez concerning same (0.1).	0.10
01/07/18	Kurtzberg, J	Emails and tel. conf. w/ Bruce Rosen, Robert Regan, and Alicyn Craig re: prep. for oral argument (0.8); review and analysis of briefs, pleadings, and cases in prep. for oral argument (1.8).	2.60
01/08/18	Kurtzberg, J	Review and analysis of briefs, pleadings, and cases in prep. for oral argument and drafted outline for oral argument (10.0).	10.00
01/09/18	Kurtzberg, J	Appearance at oral argument before Judge Vasquez and prep. for same (6.0); emails w/ Bruce Rosen, Ted Preusch, Joanne Minichetti, Bob Regan, Vincent Durante, and Alicyn Criag re: proposed statement for website and review of same (0.1).	6.10
01/15/18	Kurtzberg, J	Emails w/ Ted Preusch, Bob Regan, and Bruce Rosen re: outline of preliminary decision (0.1); review and analysis of memo re: issues raised by judge's preliminary assessment (0.1); review and analysis of transcript of judge's preliminary assessment in preparation for closed Council meeting and took notes of significant issues raised by same (0.6); tel. conf. w/ Councilmembers, Mayor Manichetti, Bob Regan, Ted Preusch, Allison Zsamba, and Bruce Rosen re: litigation and settlement strategy (1.1).	1.90

<u>DATE</u>	<u>NAME</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
01/24/18	Kurtzberg, J	Tel. conf. and emails w/ Bruce Rosen, Vinny Durante, Jon Ditzkoff, Bob Regan, Ted Preusch, and Marci Hamilton re: settlement negotiations and strategy for same (0.6).	0.60
01/30/18	Kurtzberg, J	Emails w/ Vinny Durante, Jon Ditzkoff, Marci Hamilton, Ted Preusch, Bruce Rosen, Bob Regan, Joanne Minichetti, and Allison Zsamba re: status of settlement negotiations (0.1); emails w/ Bruce Rosen re: submission concerning potential hearing testimony needed (0.1).	0.20
TOTAL TIME			23.90

-----TIME RECAP-----

<u>NAME</u>	<u>RATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
Kurtzberg, J	1140.00	23.90	27,246.00
TOTAL		23.90	\$27,246.00